

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Madison County Board of Supervisors 146 West Center Street Canton, MS 39046 / 601-855-5534 kesha.buckner@madison-co.com

November 18, 2019

To:

Board of Supervisors

From:

Kesha Buckner, Purchasing Clerk

Subject:

Award Commodity Term Bids

Attached are copies of recently-opened commodity term bids and spreadsheet tabulations. I recommend that the Board take the following action:

- 1. Award the Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 Asphalt for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to APAC-Canton at \$66.50 per ton.
- 2. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 Asphalt for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to ADCAMP at \$70.00 per ton.
- 3. Award the Term Bid for SC-1 Type II Asphalt for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to ADCAMP at \$68.00 per ton.
- 4. Award the Term Bid for BB-1 Asphalt for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to APAC-Jackson at \$58.00 per ton.
- 5. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for BB-1 ASPAHLT for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to ADCAMP at \$60.00 per ton.
- 6. Award the Term Bid for CRS-2 Liquid Asphalt for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to Ergon at \$2.75 per gallon.
- 7. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for CRS-2 Liquid Asphalt for the period November 19, 2019 September 30, 2020 to Blackledge at \$3.06 per gallon.

Dickerson & Bowen submitted specifications to indicate that they were interested in bidding on SC-1 Type 8 Asphalt; SC-1 Type II Asphalt; Cold Mix Asphalt & BB-1 Asphalt. Ultimately, they did not participate in the reverse auction.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations.

SC1-Type8

Home Administrators Site Members Page Creator Hit Statistics Agenda Builder Planning and Zoning Archives

Logout

Medition Commission Archives Create New Bid	Planni	ng and Zoning	Bid Tool	Email Manager Help B	Bid Tool				
View Pending Bids	Show	10 V entries				Search:			
View Open Bids			,				7	I.e	
View Closed Bids	ID	Name	Phone	Email	Company Name	Date Submitted	Bid Amount	View Bid	
View Public Log	2347	Mollie Murphey	(601) 939- 4493	mollie@adcampinc.com	Adcamp, Inc.	11-07-2019 10:02:36 am	\$70.00		
Bid System Log	2240	Terry May		(601) 376-	john.may@apac.com APAC-Mis	APAC-Mississippi,	Mississippi. 11-07-2019 10:04:09	\$66.50	1
Permissions	2349		4000	John May Wapac.com	INC	am	400.00		
Current Time: 11-18-2019 02:20:54 pm	2351	Mollie Murphey	(601) 939- 4493	mollie@adcampinc.com	Adcamp, Inc.	11-07-2019 11:00:00 am	\$70.00		

Showing 1 to 3 of 3 entries

Previous 1 Next

SCI-Type 2

Home Administrators Site Members Page Creator Hit Statistics Agenda Builder Planning and Zoning Archives Logout MBettion Commission Archives Planning and Zoning Bid Tool Email Manager Help Bid Tool Create New Bid View Pending Bids Show 10 V entries Search: View Open Bids Bid Amount | View Bid ID Name Phone Email Company Name | Date Submitted View Closed Bids 11-07-2019 10:02:59 \$68.00 View Public Log 2348 Mollie Murphey (601) 939-4493 mollie@adcampinc.com Adcamp, Inc. am Bid System Log Permissions Showing 1 to 1 of 1 entries Current Time: 11-18-2019 02:48:36 **Previous** 1 Next

BB-1 Apphalt

Home Administrators Site Members Page Creator Hit Statistics Agenda Builder Planning and Zoning Archives

Logout

Medition Commission Archives Create New Bid	Planni	ng and Zoning	Bid Tool	Email Manager Help I	Bid Tool				
View Pending Bids	Show	10 V entries				Search:			
View Open Bids	,					Y=	T	les sin	
View Closed Bids	ID	Name	Phone	Email	Company Name	Date Submitted	Bid Amount	View Bid	
View Public Log	2346	Mollie Murphey	(601) 939- 4493	mollie@adcampinc.com	Adcamp, Inc.	11-07-2019 10:02:14 am	\$60.00		
Bid System Log	2250 Tarri Mari	2350 Terry May (601) 376-	OSO Tass Man	(601) 376-	john.may@apac.com APAC-Mississ	APAC-Mississippi,	i. 11-07-2019 10:05:28	\$58.00	
Permissions	2350	Terry May	4000	John May Wapac.com	INC	am	400.00		
Current Time: 11-18-2019 02:58:37 pm	2352	Mollie Murphey	(601) 939- 4493	mollie@adcampinc.com	Adcamp, Inc.	11-07-2019 11:00:00 am	\$60.00		

Showing 1 to 3 of 3 entries

Previous 1 Next

CRS-2 Liquid Osphalf

170 JEN MYERS

Bid System Log

Current Time: 11-18-2019 02:50:51

Permissions

Home Administrators Site Members Page Creator Hit Statistics Agenda Builder Planning and Zoning Archives MERENTION Commission Archives Planning and Zoning Bid Tool Email Manager Help Bid Tool Create New Bid View Pending Bids Show 10 v entries Search: View Open Bids Bid View Bid View Closed Bids Date Submitted Amount Name Phone Email Company Name View Public Log 169 Amy Walker / Teresa Purifoy (601) 933-3387 amy.walker@ergon.com Ergon Asphalt & 10-03-2019 \$2.75

JMYERS@BE-INC.COM

(601) 209-4374

Showing 1 to 2 of 2 entries **Previous** 1 Next

Emulsions, Inc.

EMULSIONS, INC.

BLACKLIDGE

10:25:14 am

10-03-2019

10:28:27 am

\$3.06

Logout



Home Administrators Site Members Page Creator Hit Statistics Agenda Builder Planning and Zoning Archives Logout Melection Commission Archives Planning and Zoning Bid Tool Email Manager Help Bid Tool Create New Bid View Pending Bids Show 10 v entries Search: View Open Bids Bid Amount View Bid Company Name Date Submitted ID Name Phone Email View Closed Bids No data available in table View Public Log Bid System Log Showing 0 to 0 of 0 entries Permissions Current Time; 11-18-2019 02:50:05 **Previous** Next pm

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 SC1-TYPE 8 ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "SC1-Type 8 Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location excludes it from participating in the reverse auction and in our calculations of lowest and best bid, note here the number of miles from your company plant to the Madison County Road Department:

[65] Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for SC1-Type 8 Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Mississippi, Inc.
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 24508
Tackson, Uls 39225-4508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-954-8766
EMAIL: juhn. Maye apac. Com
(Teny May 9-24-19
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
Terry May
PRINT ALTHOPIZED DEPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HEDE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 SC1-TYPE 8 ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "SC1-Type 8 Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's locati	ion excl	udes it from
participating in the reverse auction and in	our cal	culations of lowest
and best bid, note here the number of mile	es from	your company plant to
the Madison County Road Department:	25	Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for SC1-Type 8 Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	ADCAMP, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 54246	
·	JACKSON, MS 39288-4246	
TELEPHONE:	601-939-4493	
CELL PHONE NUMBE	ER: 601-940-1343	····
EMAIL:	ralph@adcampinc.com	
V Dale	Sainer	09/27/2019
AUTHORIZED REPRE	SENTÁTIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
RALPH BARNES,	PRESIDENT	

NOTE ALL DIE GIERES COMMENS COMMENS AND DECEMBER OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPER

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 SC1-TYPE 2 ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- 2. In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "SC1-Type 2 Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

participating in the re and best bid, note her	ig it a vendor's location excludes everse auction and in our calcula e the number of miles from your Road Department: ²⁵	tions of lowest
Madison County Board provide said product in duration of said term be that it will not load quatrucks in an amount grespecific order. Furthern event that it does load of than is listed on the purneither bill nor hold Management of the purne	pany agrees that if it is awarded a dof Supervisors for SC1-Type 2 As a timely manner at the awarded to id period. The below signed compartities of SC1-Type 2 Asphalt on Meater than is listed on the purchase more, the below signed company aquantities of SC1-Type 2 Asphalt in rehase order for a specific order the adison County responsible for the eeds the purchase order amount.	ephalt that it will erm bid price for the any further agrees ladison County order for each grees that in the quantities greater at that it will
COMPANY NAME:_	ADCAMP, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 54246	
	JACKSON, MS 39288-4246	
TELEPHONE:	601-939-4493	
CELL PHONE NUMB	ER: 601-940-1343	
EMAIL:	ralph@adcampinc.com	
1 Dans	Surer	09/27/2019
AUTHORIZED REPRI	ESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
RALPH BARNES,	PRESIDENT	

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE.

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 BB1 BASE ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "BB1 Base Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location excludes it from participating in the reverse auction and in our calculations of lowest and best bid, note here the number of miles from your company plant to the Madison County Road Department:

________Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for BB1 Base Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of BB1 Base Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of BB1 Base Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of BB1 Base Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Wississipp, Inc.
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 24508
Jackson Us 39225-4508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-954-8766
EMAIL: john. may @ apac. Com
Templay 9-29-19
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 BB1 BASE ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "BB1 Base Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's locati participating in the reverse auction and in and best bid, note here the number of mile	our calc	ulations of lowest
the Madison County Road Department: _	25	Miles
The below signed company agrees that if it is Madison County Board of Supervisors for BE		•

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for BB1 Base Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of BB1 Base Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of BB1 Base Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of BB1 Base Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	ADCAMP, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 54246	
	JACKSON, MS 39288-4246	
TELEPHONE:	601-939-4493	
CELL PHONE NUMBI	ER:601-940-1343	
EMAIL:	ralph@adcampinc.com	
X Drew	Barner	09/27/2019
ÀUTHORIZED REPRE	SENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
RALPH BARNES, PRI	ESIDENT	

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 CRS 2 LIQUID ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.

مر الر --

 In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location excludes it from participating in the reverse auction and in our calculations of lowest and best bid, note here the number of miles from your company plant to the Madison County Road Department: approximately65 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 23028	
	JACKSON, MS 39225-3028	
TELEPHONE:	601-933-3387	
CELL PHONE NUM	BER: 601-497-7278	
EMAIL:amy.walker@	Pergon.com / teresa.purifoy@ergon.com	
Luz wall		September 26, 2019
AUTHORÌŻED REPI	RESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
Amy Walker, Area Sales Ma	nager	

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE.

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

CS	R2 Liguid Asphalt
No	Cover Page

AXES AND FEES SHALL BE INCLUDED IN BID IS ARE LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. ENT.

if a vendor's location excludes it from verse auction and in our calculations of lowest the number of miles from your company plant to oad Department: _______Miles

any agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the

of Supervisors for CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt that it will a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of CSR 2-Liquid Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.
ADDRESS: 12251 Bernard Parkway Ste 200
Gulfport, MG 39503
TELEPHONE: 218,863-3878
CELL PHONE NUMBER: <u>601.209.4374</u>
EMAIL: Jr wood @ be-inc.com
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
e service de la constant de la const
Jen Mucro Gales Operations Mannaer

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE.

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 -- 30 SEPT 2020 SC1-TYPE 8 ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "SC1-Type 8 Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location excludes it from participating in the reverse auction and in our calculations of lowest and best bid, note here the number of miles from your company plant t the Madison County Road Department:
The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for SC1-Type 8 Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of SC1-Type 8 Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.
COMPANY NAME: Dickerson & BOWER JAC
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 1008
Bzookhaves, Ms. 3960Z
TELEPHONE: (601) 969-2002
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601)/5]40-5 005
EMAIL: dglenn @dickersoud Bowoo.com
10/1(19

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE

DONG. Glenn

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 SC1-TYPE 2 ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- 2. In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "SC1-Type 2 Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location excludes it from participating in the reverse auction and in our calculations of lowest and best bid, note here the number of miles from your company plant the Madison County Road Department: & Miles
The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for SC1-Type 2 Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of SC1-Type 2 Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of SC1-Type 2 Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of SC1-Type 2 Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.
COMPANY NAME: Dickerson & Bower Ing
ADDRESS: P. O. Box 1008
Brookhave v, Ms. 39602
TELEPHONE: (401) 969-2002
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601) 540-5005
EMAIL: delenwedickorson and bowen . com
10/1/19
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE.

PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 COLD MIX ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "Cold Mix Asphalt" and written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location excludes it participating in the reverse auction and in our calculation and best bid, note here the number of miles from your counter the Madison County Road Department:	ons of lowest company plant to			
The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for Cold Mix Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of Cold Mix Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of Cold Mix Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of Cold Mix Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.				
COMPANY NAME: Dickerson & Bowen Inc.				
ADDRESS: Ro. Bal 1008				
BROOKHAVEN MS. 39602				
TELEPHONE: (601) 969. 2002				
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601) 540-S 005				
EMAIL: dylenwedickers out hoven.com				
/W	10/1/19			
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE			
Doo C.Glow				
PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE				

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET (NO PRICES)

TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2019 – 30 SEPT 2020 BB1 BASE ASPHALT TO PICKED UP BY MADISON COUNTY

SPECIFICATION SUBMITTAL SHEET DEADLINE: 10 A.M. 1 OCTOBER 2019

Vendors' specification submittal sheet (with no prices) will be received until 10:00 A.M. on Tuesday, October 1, 2019. Vendors may submit their specification submittal sheets using either of the two following methods:

- 1. Electronically at http://www.madison-co.com/bids.
- In a sealed envelope to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. Specification submittal sheets submitted in paper form must have "Term Bids Specifications" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

Vendors' term bid specification submittal sheets will be evaluated and vendors submitting acceptable specifications will be invited by email to submit priced bids via a live electronic reverse auction or sealed paper bids.

Final bidding for term bids will be held by live electronic reverse auctions on Thursday, October 3, 2019, beginning at 10:00 A.M., with a scheduled ending time of 11:00 A.M. Qualified vendors can access the live reverse auction via the links distributed by email to qualified vendors. Anti-sniping will be utilized for the live electronic reverse auctions, which means that the bid deadline countdown will automatically reset to 5 minutes anytime a bid is received within the final 5 minutes of the reverse auction. The anti-sniping tool can extend the bid deadline multiple times until no bid is received in the final five minutes of the reverse auction.

Sealed bids may be submitted to the Madison County Chancery Clerk's office located in the Madison County Chancery Courthouse, Rooms 225-228, 146 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046 until 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019. Sealed bids received by 10:00 A.M. on Thursday, October 3, 2019, will be entered in the live electronic reverse auction by the county purchasing department. All paper bids must have "Term Bid" and "BB1 Base Asphalt" written on the outside of the sealed envelope.

For use in determining if a vendor's location	n excludes i	t from	
participating in the reverse auction and in o	our calculati	ions of lowest	•
and best bid, note here the number of miles	from your	company plai	nt to
the Madison County Road Department:	26.8	Miles	

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for BB1 Base Asphalt that it will provide said product in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not load quantities of BB1 Base Asphalt on Madison County trucks in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does load quantities of BB1 Base Asphalt in quantities greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of BB1 Base Asphalt that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	Dickersont Bowen Dr.		
ADDDEGG.			
ADDRESS:	P.O. Box 1008		
	Brookhaver, Ms. 39602		
TELEPHONE:	(Co1) 969-2002		
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601) 540-5005			
EMAIL: delenne	edictors un englosses.com		
		16/1/19	
AUTHORIZED REPRE	SENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE	
	Jon L. Glewn		
PRINT AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE			